
From: Jim Omahen jim@mediadistrict.org
Subject: Re: BID Holiday dinner @ GRUB

Date: October 27, 2014 at 9:50 AM
To: Laurie Goldman laurielgoldman@earthlink.net
Cc: steven@mediadistrict.org, Mike Malick Mike.Malick@marcusmillichap.com

Laurie, terrific!  And many thanks for handling this.  I will do a check and have it for tomorrow
(Tuesday) for signing.  Thanks again.

--
Jim Omahen, Operations Manager
Hollywood Media District BID
1304 N. Highland Ave. #200
Hollywood, CA 90028
Ph 323.860.0088
Fax 323.860.0089
www.mediadistrict.org  

On 10/24/14 8:16 PM, "Laurie Goldman" <laurielgoldman@earthlink.net> wrote:

Hi Jim – do you want to write a check for the deposit for the next
round of checks?  The proposal was attached to an earlier email.
 
Let me know !

Hugs,
L
 

From: Malick, Mike [mailto:Mike.Malick@marcusmillichap.com] 
Sent: Friday, October 24, 2014 6:46 PM
To: Laurie Goldman
Cc: Jim Omahen; steven@mediadistrict.org
Subject: Re: BID Holiday dinner @ GRUB

Approved. 

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 24, 2014, at 5:58 PM, "Laurie Goldman" <laurielgoldman@earthlink.net> wrote:

Libby put together the attached yummy proposal – as you
will see she gave the BID a discount plus a Laurie
discount – this is an amazing price!  While I’m only one
vote, I think BID can afford to pay for our holiday dinner
!

Hugs,
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Hugs,
Laurie
 

From: Laurie Goldman [mailto:laurielgoldman@earthlink.net] 
Sent: Friday, October 24, 2014 5:33 PM
To: Jim Omahen (jim@mediadistrict.org); steven@mediadistrict.org
Cc: 'Mike Malick (Mike.malick@marcusmillichap.com)'
Subject: BID Holiday dinner @ GRUB

Greetings Gents,
 
It would be much easier for Betty if you would allow me
to coordinate our Holiday dinner on the 15th.
 
As I understand the requests from Ron Groeper, a buffet
dinner, and from Jim the per person cost for food and
nonalcoholic beverages.  I will pay for the wine and beer.
 
 
I’ve asked Libby to prepare a proposal for our review.
 She will be in Chicago next week, but can provide the
proposal by the 5th –still plenty of time.
 
Just need to resolve if the BID is hosting or Directors are
paying their own way.  As I recall from my first holiday
dinner at Ammo, we each paid $50.00 – am I
remembering that correctly?
 
Enjoy a lovely weekend.
 
Hugs,
Laurie
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